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Point 2.  LONG AGO

Luke 2 v 1-20
At that time the Roman emperor, Augustus, decreed that a census should be taken 
throughout the Roman Empire. All returned to their own ancestral towns to register 
for this census and because Joseph was a descendant of King David, he had to go to 
Bethlehem in Judea, David’s ancient home. He travelled there from the village of 
Nazareth in Galilee. He took with him Mary, to whom he was engaged, who was now
expecting a child. And while they were there, the time came for her baby to be born. 
She gave birth to her firstborn son. She wrapped him snugly in strips of cloth and laid
him in a manger, because there was no lodging available for them.

That night there were shepherds staying in the fields nearby, guarding their flocks of 
sheep. Suddenly, an angel of the Lord appeared among them, and the radiance of the 
Lord’s glory surrounded them. They were terrified, but the angel reassured them. 
“Don’t be afraid!” he said. “I bring you good news that will bring great joy to all 
people. The Saviour—yes, the Messiah, the Lord—has been born today in 
Bethlehem, the city of David! And you will recognize him by this sign: You will find 
a baby wrapped snugly in strips of cloth, lying in a manger.” Suddenly, the angel was 
joined by a vast host of others—the armies of heaven—praising God and saying, 
“Glory to God in highest heaven, and peace on earth to those with whom God is 
pleased.”

When the angels had returned to heaven, the shepherds said to each other, “Let’s go 
to Bethlehem! Let’s see this thing that has happened, which the Lord has told us 
about.” They hurried to the village and found Mary and Joseph. And there was the 
baby, lying in the manger.  After seeing him, the shepherds told everyone what had 
happened and what the angel had said to them about this child. All who heard the 
shepherds’ story were astonished, but Mary kept all these things in her heart and 
thought about them often. The shepherds went back to their flocks, glorifying and 
praising God for all they had heard and seen. It was just as the angel had told them.

Mark 6 v 1-3
Jesus left that part of the country and returned with his disciples to Nazareth, his 
hometown.  The next Sabbath he began teaching in the synagogue, and many who 
heard him were amazed. They asked, “Where did he get all this wisdom and the 
power to perform such miracles?” Then they scoffed, “He’s just a carpenter, the son 
of Mary and the brother of James, Joseph, Judas, and Simon. And his sisters live right
here among us.” 



Point 3.   BY THE RIVER

Mark 1 v 9-13
One day Jesus came from Nazareth in Galilee, and John baptized him in the Jordan 
River. As Jesus came up out of the water, he saw the heavens splitting apart and the 
Holy Spirit descending on him like a dove. And a voice from heaven said, “You are 
my dearly loved Son, and you bring me great joy.”
The Spirit then compelled Jesus to go into the wilderness, where he was tempted by 
Satan for forty days. He was out among the wild animals, and angels took care of him

Point 4.    LET’S GO WITH HIM

Mark 1 v 14-20
Later on, after John was arrested, Jesus went into Galilee, where he preached God’s 
Good News.  “The time promised by God has come at last!” he announced. “The 
Kingdom of God is near! Repent of your sins and believe the Good News!”

One day as Jesus was walking along the shore of the Sea of Galilee, he saw Simon 
and his brother Andrew throwing a net into the water, for they fished for a living.  
Jesus called out to them, “Come, follow me, and I will show you how to fish for 
people!” And they left their nets at once and followed him.   A little farther up the 
shore Jesus saw Zebedee’s sons, James and John, in a boat repairing their nets.  He 
called them at once, and they also followed him, leaving their father, Zebedee, in the 
boat with the hired men.



Point 5   MIRACLES

Mark 6 v 34-44
Jesus saw the huge crowd as he stepped from the boat, and he had compassion on 
them because they were like sheep without a shepherd. So he began teaching them 
many things. 

Late in the afternoon his disciples came to him and said, “This is a remote place, and 
it’s already getting late. Send the crowds away so they can go to the nearby farms and
villages and buy something to eat.” But Jesus said, “You feed them.” “With what?” 
they asked. “We’d have to work for months to earn enough money to buy food for all 
these people!”  “How much bread do you have?” he asked. “Go and find out.”

They came back and reported, “We have five loaves of bread and two fish.” Then 
Jesus told the disciples to have the people sit down in groups on the green grass. So 
they sat down in groups of fifty or a hundred. Jesus took the five loaves and two fish, 
looked up toward heaven, and blessed them. Then, breaking the loaves into pieces, he
kept giving the bread to the disciples so they could distribute it to the people. He also 
divided the fish for everyone to share.  They all ate as much as they wanted, and 
afterward, the disciples picked up twelve baskets of leftover bread and fish.  A total of
5,000 men and their families were fed.

Point 6.  PALM SUNDAY

Mark 11 v 7-10
Then they brought the colt to Jesus and threw their garments over it, and he sat on it. 
Many in the crowd spread their garments on the road ahead of him, and others spread 
leafy branches they had cut in the fields. Jesus was in the center of the procession, 
and the people all around him were shouting,

“Hosanna, Praise God!
Blessings on the one who comes in the name of the LORD!
Blessings on the coming Kingdom of our ancestor David!
Praise God in highest heaven!”



Point 7.  THIRTY SILVER COINS

Matthew 26 v 14-16
Then Judas Iscariot, one of the twelve disciples, went to the leading priests and asked,
“How much will you pay me to betray Jesus to you?” And they gave him thirty pieces
of silver. From that time on, Judas began looking for an opportunity to betray Jesus.

Point 8.  FOOT WASHING

John 13 v 3-5, 12-17
Jesus knew that the Father had given him authority over everything and that he had 
come from God and would return to God. So he got up from the table, took off his 
robe, wrapped a towel around his waist, and poured water into a basin. Then he began
to wash the disciples’ feet, drying them with the towel he had around him. 

After washing their feet, he put on his robe again and sat down and asked, “Do you 
understand what I was doing?  You call me ‘Teacher’ and ‘Lord,’ and you are right, 
because that’s what I am. And since I, your Lord and Teacher, have washed your feet, 
you ought to wash each other’s feet.  I have given you an example to follow. Do as I 
have done to you. I tell you the truth, slaves are not greater than their master. Nor is 
the messenger more important than the one who sends the message. Now that you 
know these things, God will bless you for doing them.



Point 9.  THE LAST SUPPER

Luke 22  v 14-20
When the time came, Jesus and the apostles sat down together at the table.Jesus said, 
“I have been very eager to eat this Passover meal with you before my suffering 
begins.  For I tell you now that I won’t eat this meal again until its meaning is 
fulfilled in the Kingdom of God.” Then he took a cup of wine and gave thanks to God
for it. Then he said, “Take this and share it among yourselves.  For I will not drink 
wine again until the Kingdom of God has come.”

He took some bread and gave thanks to God for it. Then he broke it in pieces and 
gave it to the disciples, saying, “This is my body, which is given for you. Do this in 
remembrance of me.” After supper he took another cup of wine and said, “This cup is
the new covenant between God and his people—an agreement confirmed with my 
blood, which is poured out as a sacrifice for you.

Point 10.  THE CRUCIFIXION

Mark 15 v 22-26, 33-39
Tthey brought Jesus to a place called Golgotha (which means “Place of the Skull”).  
They offered him wine drugged with myrrh, but he refused it.  Then the soldiers 
nailed him to the cross. They divided his clothes and threw dice] to decide who 
would get each piece.  It was nine o’clock in the morning when they crucified him. A 
sign announced the charge against him. It read, “The King of the Jews.”  Two 
revolutionaries were crucified with him, one on his right and one on his left. 

At noon, darkness fell across the whole land until three o’clock. Then at three o’clock
Jesus called out with a loud voice, “Eloi, Eloi, lema sabachthani?” which means 
“My God, my God, why have you abandoned me?”  Some of the bystanders 
misunderstood and thought he was calling for the prophet Elijah.  One of them ran 
and filled a sponge with sour wine, holding it up to him on a reed stick so he could 
drink. “Wait!” he said. “Let’s see whether Elijah comes to take him down!”

Then Jesus uttered another loud cry and breathed his last.  And the curtain in the 
sanctuary of the Temple was torn in two, from top to bottom. When the Roman 
officer who stood facing him saw how he had died, he exclaimed, “This man truly 
was the Son of God!”



Point 11.    THE TOMB

Mark 15 v 43-46
Joseph of Arimathea took a risk and went to Pilate and asked for Jesus’ body; Joseph 
was an honored member of the high council, and he was waiting for the Kingdom of 
God to come. Pilate couldn’t believe that Jesus was already dead, so he called for the 
Roman officer and asked if he had died yet.  The officer confirmed that Jesus was 
dead, so Pilate told Joseph he could have the body. 

Joseph bought a long sheet of linen cloth. Then he took Jesus’ body down from the 
cross, wrapped it in the cloth, and laid it in a tomb that had been carved out of the 
rock. Then he rolled a stone in front of the entrance. 

Point 12.  JESUS IS ALIVE

Mark 16 v 1-7

Saturday evening, when the Sabbath ended, Mary Magdalene, Mary the mother of 
James, and Salome went out and purchased burial spices so they could anoint Jesus’ 
body. Very early on Sunday morning, just at sunrise, they went to the tomb. On the 
way they were asking each other, “Who will roll away the stone for us from the 
entrance to the tomb?” But as they arrived, they looked up and saw that the stone, 
which was very large, had already been rolled aside.

When they entered the tomb, they saw a young man clothed in a white robe sitting on
the right side. The women were shocked, but the angel said, “Don’t be alarmed.  You 
are looking for Jesus of Nazareth, who was crucified.  He isn’t here!  He is risen from
the dead! Look, this is where they laid his body.  Now go and tell his disciples, 
including Peter, that Jesus is going ahead of you to Galilee. You will see him there, 
just as he told you before he died.”

.You can read more online at www.biblegateway.com  
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